

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
	JEFFERSON COUNTY CLERK 175 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601						
1	CHAIR, TASK, FLEXFIT DEXLEY MESH, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 45.3-50.8"H X 28.2"W X 28.6"D, HEIGHT ADJUSTABLE ARMS, SYNCHRO TILT, 5 CASTERS, 275 LB CAPACITY, 7 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES UNION & SCALE MODEL #UN56946V-CC	9	NO AWARD				
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	9	\$219.00	\$1,971.00	HON - HCAT1MM.Z1.A.H.M.ACC.F10.AL.SB.T	N/A	\$420.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	9	\$158.51	\$1,426.59	HON - HVL525.ES10	PC68432	\$382.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	9	\$460.51	\$4,144.59	OFFICE SOURCE 90511ALM 905HR	N/A	\$1325.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	9	\$167.43	\$1,506.87	NBF 224426	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	9	\$243.46	\$2,191.14	H-2809-1KY-BK-GG	N/A	N/A
2	CHAIR, TASK, TEMPUR-PEDIC MESH, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 36.2-39.8"H X 26.8"W X 24.4"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 19.9"H X 20.5"W X 19.9"D, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 18.9-22.4"H X 19.7"W X 20.5"D, ADJUSTABLE ARMS, CENTER TILT, SWIVEL, RECLINE, FIXED LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 CASTERS, 250 LB CAPACITY, LIMITED WARRANTY, STAPLES TEMPUR-PEDIC MODEL #TP8000	9					
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	9	\$151.00	\$1,359.00	HON - HVL581.ES10.T	PC68432	\$409.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	9	\$211.68	\$1,905.12	HON - HCT1MM.Y1.A.H.M.CU10.AL.SB.T	PC68432	\$484.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	9	\$250.69	\$2,256.21	GLOBAL OTG1769B	PC68336	\$583.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	9	\$306.97	\$2,762.73	NBF 56043	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	9	\$196.20	\$1,765.80	ESS-3050	N/A	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
	JEFFERSON COUNTY DISTRICT ATTORNEY 175 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601						
3	CHAIR, EXECUTIVE, BIG & TALL, LEATHER/FAUX LEATHER, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 41-44-25"H X 28"W X 30"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 20"W X 25.5"D, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 20"W X 19.75"D X 17.5-21"H, FIXED ARMS, LOCKING-TILT, SWIVEL, 5 CASTERS, 250 LB CAPACITY, 5 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES FLASH FURNITURE MODEL #BT9896H	2	NO AWARD				
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS INTIVITY	2	\$159.50	\$319.00	HON - HVL151.SB11	PC68432	\$431.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	2	\$294.20	\$588.40	HON - HVL585.E510.T	PC68432	\$709.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	2	\$221.45	\$442.90	GLOBAL OTG1618B	PC68336	\$515.00 LIST
		2	\$420.22	\$840.44	FLASH BT9896H (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	2	\$269.99	\$539.98	FLASH BT-9896H-GG (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
4	CHAIR, EXECUTIVE OFFICE, BRISTOL OCTASPRING, BONDED LEATHER, COLOR: DARK GRAY, DIMENSIONS: BACK HEIGHT: 42-50-46-25"H, SEAT HEIGHT: 19-22-75"H, WIDTH: 28-75"W, DEPTH: 30-75"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 21-25"W X 24"D, ADJUSTABLE ARMS, RECLINE, SWIVEL TILT, LUMBAR SUPPORT, HEAD REST, 275LB CAPACITY, 5 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES DORMEO MODEL #49583	1	ORDERING 3				
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS INTIVITY	1	\$177.00	\$177.00	HON - HVL402.EN11	PC68432	\$479.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$227.64	\$227.64	HON - HVL103.SB11	PC68432	\$512.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$283.95	\$283.95	OFFICE SOURCE L88LBVS	N/A	\$87.00 LIST
	WB MASON	1	\$415.72	\$415.72	NBF 56985	N/A	N/A
		1	\$160.53	\$160.53	CH-00095-BK-GG	N/A	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
6	JEFFERSON COUNTY HIGHWAY 21897 COUNTY ROUTE 190 WATERTOWN NY 13601  CHAIR, HIGH BACK, EXECUTIVE, FABRIC, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 44.1"H X 26.5"W X 27"D, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 21"W X 17"D, FIXED ARMS, ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SUPPORT, CENTER-TILT, RECLINE, SWIVEL, 5 CASTERS, 250 LB CAPACITY, 5 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES HON MODEL #BSXVL601VA10	3	ORDERING 5				
<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>		<b>3</b>	<b>\$117.00</b>	<b>\$351.00</b>	<b>HON - HVL601.VA10 (EXACT MATCH)</b>	<b>PC68432</b>	<b>\$317.00 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	3	\$131.54	\$394.62	HON - HVL601.VA10 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$317.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	3	\$120.83	\$362.49	GLOBAL OTG11768	PC68336	\$281.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	3	\$337.10	\$1,011.29	HON HVL601.VA10 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	3	\$117.45	\$352.35	HON HVL601 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	N/A
<b>JEFFERSON COUNTY HUMAN RESOURCES</b> 175 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601							
7	CHAIR, MANAGERS, SUTHERLAND COLLECTION, BONDED LEATHER, COLOR: GREY, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 40.5-43.5"H X 23.5"W X 29.5"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 27"H X 21"W, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 22.5"H X 20.75"W X 18"D, FIXED ARMS, LUMBAR SUPPORT, CENTER-TILT, 5 CASTERS, 275 LB CAPACITY, LIFETIME WARRANTY, NBF LA-Z-BOY ITEM #223753	1					
<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>		<b>1</b>	<b>\$159.00</b>	<b>\$159.00</b>	<b>HON - HVL151.SB11</b>	<b>PC68432</b>	<b>\$431.00 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	1	\$212.46	\$212.46	HON - HVL103.SB11	PC68432	\$512.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$218.87	\$218.87	GLOBAL OTG118588	PC68336	\$509.00 LIST
<b>NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE</b>		<b>1</b>	<b>\$343.75</b>	<b>\$343.75</b>	<b>NBF 223753 (EXACT MATCH)</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>
	WB MASON	1	\$357.69	\$375.69	HON HVL685.SB11	PC68432	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYS OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
	JEFFERSON COUNTY INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY 175 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601						
8	FILE CABINET, VERTICAL, 3 DRAWER (BOX/BOX/FILE), LETTER SIZE, MOBILE, BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 27.75"H x 15"W x 19.88"D, LOCKING, LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY, STAPLES MODEL #ST60430/24874D	1	NO AWARD				
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	1	\$178.50	\$178.50	HON-BRIGADE - H33720R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$676.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	1	\$200.27	\$200.27	HON - H33720R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$382.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$220.16	\$220.16	GLOBAL GMP-19BBF	PC68336	\$512.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$436.09	\$436.09	HON H33720R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$178.80	\$178.80	HON H33720N.P	PC68432	N/A
9	FILE CABINET, VERTICAL, 2 DRAWER, LETTER SIZE, MOBILE, BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 27.75"H x 15"W x 22.88"D, LOCKING, LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY, STAPLES MODEL #ST60422/25171D	1	ORDERING 1				
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	1	\$184.00	\$184.00	HON-BRIGADE - H33823R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$696.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	1	\$200.27	\$200.27	HON - H33820R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$382.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$226.18	\$226.18	GLOBAL GMP23FF	PC68336	\$526.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$449.06	\$449.06	HON H33823R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$184.09	\$184.09	HON H33823N.P	PC68432	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.							
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYS OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
10	FILE CABINET, VERTICAL, 3 DRAWER (BOX/BOX/FILE), LETTER SIZE, MOBILE, BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 27.75"H X 15"W X 22.88"D, LOCKING, LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY, STAPLES MODEL #ST60428/25170D	1	ORDERING 3				
	<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>\$184.00</b>	<b>\$184.00</b>	<b>HON-BRIGADE - H33723R.L.P</b>	<b>PC68432</b>	<b>\$696.00 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	1	\$200.27	\$200.27	HON - H33720R.L.PP	PC68432	\$382.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$226.18	\$226.18	GLOBAL GMP-23BBF	PC68336	\$526.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$449.06	\$449.06	HON H33720R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$184.09	\$184.09	HON H33723N.P	PC68432	N/A
	<b>JEFFERSON COUNTY OFFICE FOR THE AGING</b>						
	<b>175 ARSENAL STREET</b>						
	<b>WATERTOWN NY 13601</b>						
11	CHAIR, MANAGERS, BIG & TALL, DRISCOLL SERIES, MESH BACK, FABRIC COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 39.7-46.8"H X 31.7"W X 28.6"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 24.3-25.1"H X 22.7"W, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 17.5-21.7"H X 23.6"W X 19.9"D, HEIGHT ADJUSTABLE ARMS, LOCKING TILT WITH TENSION CONTROL, RECLINE, ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 CASTERS, 400 LB CAPACITY, LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY, STAPLES DRISCOLL MODEL #28354	1	NO AWARD				
	<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>\$262.50</b>	<b>\$262.50</b>	<b>HON - HVL585.ES10.T</b>	<b>PC68432</b>	<b>\$709.00 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	1	\$638.11	\$638.11	HON - HLWMBT.Y4.A.A.IM.CU10.SB.N	PC68432	\$1459.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$411.85	\$411.85	OFFICE SOURCE 44088A	N/A	\$1185.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$392.10	\$392.10	NBF 57020	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$151.53	\$151.53	HON HVL581.ES10.T	PC68432	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
12	CHAIR, TASK, MID-BACK, BIG & TALL, HON IGNITION 2.0 SERIES, MESH BACK, FABRIC COLOR: 4-WAY BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 47"H X 30"W X 30"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 24.75"H X 22.75"W, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 23.5"W X 20.25"D, ALL ADJUSTABLE ARMS, SYNCHRO-TILT, ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 ALL SURFACE CASTERS, 450 LB CAPACITY, HON MODEL #HIWMBT.Y4.V.A.IM.CU10.BL.SB.T.N	1					
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	1	\$588.00	\$588.00	HON - HIWM8.A.A.U.CU10.T.SB	PC68432	\$1509.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	1	\$499.46	\$499.46	HON - HIWMBT.Y4.V.A.IM.CU10.BL.SB.T.N (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$1142.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$709.77	\$709.77	HON HIWMBT.Y4 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	<b>WB MASON</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>\$445.95</b>	<b>\$445.95</b>	<b>HON HIWMBT.Y4 (EXACT MATCH)</b>	<b>PC68432</b>	<b>N/A</b>
	JEFFERSON COUNTY PLANNING 175 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601						
13	CHAIR, EXECUTIVE, LA-Z-BOY ARCADIAN SERIES, BONDED LEATHER, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 43.25-46.25"H X 28.25"W X 29.5"D, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 18.75-21.75"H X 22.25"W X 19"D, FIXED ARMS, CENTER TILT, RECLINE, SWIVEL, ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 CASTERS, 275 LB CAPACITY, 10 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES LA-Z-BOY MODEL #60009	1	NO AWARD				
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	1	\$177.25	\$177.25	HON - HVL402.EN11	PC68432	\$479.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	1	\$212.46	\$212.46	HON - HVL103.SB11	PC68432	\$512.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$262.30	\$262.30	GLOBAL OTG11648B	PC68336	\$610.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	WB MASON	1	\$282.32	\$282.32	HON HVL844.N.SB11	PC68432	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
14	CHAIR, LA-Z-BOY ABERDEEN SERIES, LEATHER, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 45.5-48.5"H X 28.75"W X 31.5"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 30.5"H X 22"W, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 22.75"W X 22"D, FIXED ARMS, SWIVEL TILT, RECLINE, ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 CASTERS, 275 LB CAPACITY, 10 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES LA-Z-BOY MODEL #51545	1	\$280.00	\$280.00	HON - H2091.H.UR10.T	PC68432	\$718.00 LIST
		1	\$212.46	\$212.46	HON - HVL103.SB11	PC68432	\$512.00 LIST
		1	\$218.87	\$218.87	GLOBAL OTG1858B	PC68336	\$509.00 LIST
		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1	WB MASON	1	\$189.70	\$189.70	HON HVL103.SB11	PC68432	N/A
15	CHAIR, TASK, LA-Z-BOY SERIES, MESH BACK, MOLDED FOAM SEAT, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 46.9-50.8"H X 27.8"W X 27.8"D, HEIGHT ADJUSTABLE ARMS, LOCKING TILT, ADJUSTABLE LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 CASTERS, 275 LB CAPACITY, 10 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES LA-Z-BOY MODEL #60021	1	ORDERING 2				
		1	\$191.50	\$191.50	HON - HVL712.MM10	PC68432	\$517.00 LIST
		1	\$211.68	\$211.68	HON - HCT1MM.Y1.A.H.M.CU10.A.L.SB.T	PC68432	\$484.00 LIST
		1	\$209.23	\$209.23	OFFICE SOURCE 656MBF	N/A	\$602.00 LIST
NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
1	WB MASON	1	\$303.81	\$303.81	HIWMMHR.Yo.A.H.IM.CU10.BL.S B.T.HR	PC68432	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
	JEFFERSON COUNTY PROBATION 175 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601						
16	FILE CABINET, VERTICAL, 2 DRAWER, LETTER SIZE, BLACK, MOBILE, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 28"H x 15"W x 22.875"D, BALL BEARING SUSPENSION, ONE KEY INTERCHANGEABLE LOCK CORE, CASTERS FIXED IN FRONT, SWIVEL IN BACK, COUNTERWEIGHTED, FULL RADIUS DRAWER PULL, LIFETIME WARRANTY, STAPLES HON MODEL #H18823RLP	2					
	<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>\$225.00</b>	<b>\$450.00</b>	<b>HON - H18823R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)</b>	<b>PC68432</b>	<b>\$851.00 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	2	\$200.27	\$400.54	HON - H33820R.L.P	PC68432	\$676.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	2	\$226.18	\$452.36	GLOBAL GMP-23FF	PC68336	\$526.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	2	\$533.80	\$1,067.61	HON H18823R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	2	\$225.09	\$450.18	HON H18823R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	N/A
17	FILE CABINET, VERTICAL, 3 DRAWER, LETTER SIZE, BLACK, MOBILE, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 28"H x 15"W x 22.875"D, BALL BEARING SUSPENSION, ONE KEY INTERCHANGEABLE LOCK CORE, CASTERS FIXED IN FRONT, SWIVEL IN BACK, COUNTERWEIGHTED, FULL RADIUS DRAWER PULL, LIFETIME WARRANTY, STAPLES HON MODEL #H18723RP	1					
	<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>\$225.00</b>	<b>\$225.00</b>	<b>HON - H18723R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)</b>	<b>PC68432</b>	<b>\$851.00 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	1	\$200.27	\$200.27	HON - H33720R.L.P	PC68432	\$676.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	1	\$226.18	\$226.18	GLOBAL GMP-23BBF	PC68336	\$526.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$533.80	\$533.80	HON H18723R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$225.09	\$225.09	HON H18723R.L.P (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	N/A



**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID	
18	CHAIR, TURCOTTE LUXURA SERIES, FAUX LEATHER, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 42.5-46.3"H X 27.8"W X 29.3"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 27"H X 20.1"W, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 18-21.7"H X 20.5"W X 18.5"D, FIXED ARMS, CENTER TILT, RECLINE, SWIVEL, LUMBAR SUPPORT, 250 LB CAPACITY, LIMITED WARRANTY, STAPLES TURCOTTE MODEL #23094-CC	1	\$148.00	\$148.00	HON - HVST305	N/A	\$254.00 LIST	
			\$272.63	\$272.63	HON - HVL108.SB11	PC68432	\$657.00 LIST	
			\$153.08	\$153.08	GLOBAL OTG1782B	PC68336	\$356.00 LIST	
			\$214.75	\$214.75	NBF 56602	N/A	N/A	
<b>WB MASON</b>								
19	SHREDDER, CROSS-CUT, 24 SHEET CAPACITY, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 25.6"H X 16.4"W X 12.3"D, 10 GALLON WASTE BASKET, AUTOMATIC START-STOP, JAM PROTECTION, AUTOMATIC AND MANUAL REVERSE, NOISE LEVEL: 65dB, PAPER ENTRY WIDTH: 8.7", SHRED SIZE: 0.16" X 1.57", P-4 SECURIT LEVEL, SHREDS CDS, DVDS, CREDIT CARDS, PAPER CLIPS, AND STAPLES, 3 YEAR WARRANTY, STAPLES TRU RED MODEL #TR-BXC243A-CC	1	NO AWARD					
			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
			\$253.68	\$253.68	AMAZON - AU2440XA	N/A	\$657.00 LIST	
			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>WB MASON</b>								
1	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$370.57	\$370.57	UNV48120	N/A	N/A	

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYS OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
	JEFFERSON COUNTY REAL PROPERTY 175 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601						
20	CHAIR, EXECUTIVE, HIGH-BACK, FABRIC WITH FOAM PADDING, FABRIC COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 45-49"H X 30"W X 33-5"D, BACK DIMENSIONS: 31"H X 23-25"W X 6" THICK, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 20-24"H X 25-25"W X 23-5"D X 6" THICK, ADJUSTABLE ARMS, LOCKING TILT AND TILT TENSION, LUMBAR SUPPORT, CONTOURED SEAT, 5 DUAL WHEELED CASTERS, 400 LB CAPACITY, LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY (3 YR FABRIC AND FOAM), K-LOG ANDRE MODEL #OTC-39F	3	ORDERING 2 \$546.00	\$1,638.00	GLOBAL - 1253-0, LE63, C65, C3, SF, BK	PC68336	\$1270.00 LIST
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	3	\$657.97	\$1,979.91	HON - HIWM8.A.A.U.CU10.T.SB	PC68432	\$1509.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	3	\$367.45	\$1,108.35	<b>OFFICE SOURCE 993BLK</b>	N/A	<b>\$1063.00 LIST</b>
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	3	\$540.49	\$1,561.47	NBF 56031	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	3	\$477.43	\$1,251.39	GO-1534-BK-FAB-CG	N/A	N/A
21	CHAIR, MID BACK, HON SERIES, VINYL MATERIAL, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 43-25"H X 26"W X 28"D, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 20"W X 18"D, FIXED LOOP ARMS, CENTER TILT, TILT TENSION, TILT LOCK, SWIVEL, LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 CASTERS, 250 LB CAPACITY, 5 YEAR LIMITED WARRANTY, HON MODEL #HVL402.EN11	3	ORDERING 1 \$198.77	\$596.31	HON - HVL402.EN11 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$479.00 LIST
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	3	\$177.00	\$531.00	HON - HVL402.EN11 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$479.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	3	\$221.45	\$664.35	GLOBAL OTG1618B	PC68336	\$515.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	3	\$434.08	\$978.14	HON HVL402.EN11 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	3	\$177.47	\$532.41	HON HVL402.EN11 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	N/A
	WB MASON	3					

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
	JEFFERSON COUNTY RECYCLING 27138 NYS ROUTE 12 WATERTOWN NY 13601						
22	CHAIR, OFFICE, MESH BACK, FABRIC SEAT, FABRIC COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 38-58"H X 37-36"W X 24.21"L, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 18-22"H, HEIGHT ADJUSTABLE ARMS, TILT MECHANISM, SWIVEL, 5 DUAL WHEELED CASTERS, 275 LB CAPACITY, 5 YEAR WARRANTY, BUSH INDUSTRIES MODEL #CH1205BLF-03	1	\$273.99	\$273.99	BUSH - CH1205BLF-03 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68294	\$487.00 LIST
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS INTIVITY	1	\$131.54	\$131.54	HON - HVL601.VA10	PC68432	\$317.00 LIST
	<b>JUST THE RIGHT STUFF</b>	1	<b>\$246.39</b>	<b>\$246.39</b>	<b>GLOBAL OTG3191B</b>	<b>PC68336</b>	<b>\$573.00 LIST</b>
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$326.45	\$326.45	BUSH CH1205BLF-03 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$258.73	\$258.73	BUSH CH1205BLF-03 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
23	STORAGE CABINET, 2 DOOR, LOCKING, WITH BOOK CASE HUTCH, COLOR: STORM GRAY, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 70.09"H X 35.67"W X 23.35"L, 50 LB CABINET SHELF CAPACITY, EURO-STYLE HINGES, 10 YEAR WARRANTY, BUSH INDUSTRIES MODEL #OF5008SGSU	1	\$583.81	\$583.81	BUSH - OF5008SGSU (EXACT MATCH)	PC68294	\$1397.00 LIST
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS INTIVITY	1	\$747.76	\$747.76	HON - H885LS.L.P8T	PC68432	\$1802.00 LIST
	<b>JUST THE RIGHT STUFF</b>	1	<b>\$410.65</b>	<b>\$410.65</b>	<b>GLOBAL SI3622C SI36HO SI36SIDR</b>	<b>PC68336</b>	<b>\$955.00 LIST</b>
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$498.74	\$498.74	BUSH OF5008SGSU (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$754.91	\$754.91	BUSH OF5008SGSU (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A


**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
24	DESK, L-SHAPED (72"W) WITH HUTCH (72"W), COLOR: STORM GRAY/WHITE, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 64.96"H X 71.02"W X 71.02"L, PULL-OUT SHELF FOR KEYBOARD/LAPTOP, VERTICAL STORAGE CABINET WITH ADJUSTABLE SHELF, BOX DRAWER, FILE DRAWER - LETTER SIZE, 6 YEAR WARRANTY, BUSH INDUSTRIES MODEL #SET001SGWH	1	\$1,014.99	\$1,014.99	BUSH - SET000SGWH	N/A	\$1014.99 LIST
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	1	\$1,014.99	\$1,014.99	HON - H10592.LPT1LPT1 / H105681.LPT1 / H10534.LPT1LPT1/ H105104.LPT1LPT1/ H105102.LPT1LPT1	PC68432	\$4407.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	1	\$1,927.46	\$1,927.46			
	<b>JUST THE RIGHT STUFF</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>\$840.22</b>	<b>\$840.22</b>	<b>GLOBAL SL730DS</b>	<b>PC68336</b>	<b>\$1954.00 LIST</b>
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	1	\$1,195.23	\$1,195.23	BUSH SET001SGWH (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	1	\$947.23	\$947.23	BUSH SET001SGWH (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	<b>JEFFERSON COUNTY SHERIFF 753 WATERMAN DRIVE WATERTOWN NY 13601</b>						
25	CHAIR, EXECUTIVE, HON WAVE SERIES, MESH BACK, SOFTWEAVE LEATHER SEAT, FABRIC COLOR: BLACK, DIMENSIONS: BACK DIMENSIONS: 23"H, SEAT DIMENSIONS: 21"W X 19"D, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 44.63"H X 27.5"W X 28"D, HEIGHT ADJUSTABLE ARMS, SWIVEL TILT, LUMBAR SUPPORT, 5 CASTERS, 250 LB CAPACITY, 5 YEAR WARRANTY, HON MODEL #HVL701.SB11	15	\$279.00	\$4,185.00	HON - HVL701.SB11 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$756.00 LIST
	INTERIOR INNOVATIONS	15	\$313.71	\$4,705.65	HON - HVL701.SB11 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	\$756.00 LIST
	INTIVITY	15	\$242.94	\$3,644.10	<b>OFFICE SOURCE 656MBF</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$699.00 LIST W/ FAUX LEATHER SEAT</b>
	<b>JUST THE RIGHT STUFF</b>	<b>15</b>	<b>\$242.94</b>	<b>\$3,644.10</b>	<b>OFFICE SOURCE 656MBF</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$699.00 LIST W/ FAUX LEATHER SEAT</b>
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	15	\$514.38	\$7,715.66	HON HVL701.SB11 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	15	\$280.10	\$4,201.50	HON HVL701.SB11 (EXACT MATCH)	PC68432	N/A

**BID #22-23  
OFFICE FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY  
BID TABULATION PART 1**

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY & NO MINIMUM PURCHASE IS GUARANTEED. PRICING TO INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY. INSTALLATION IS NOT REQUIRED.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY	BID PRICE EACH DELIVERED	BID PRICE TOTAL	MANUF. & MODEL BID	NEW YORK STATE CONTRACT NUMBER / OTHER COUNTY'S BID NUMBER - IF APPLICABLE	LIST PRICE & EITHER NYSC OR OTHER COUNTY'S BID
26	END TABLE, WINSOME HENRY SERIES, COMPOSITE WOOD, COLOR: BLACK, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 25"H X 18.9"W X 14.96"D, SHELF AND BOTTOM COMPARTMENT WITH DOOR CLOSURE, STAPLES HENRY MODEL #20115	1					
	<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>\$56.00</b>	<b>\$56.00</b>	<b>BUSH - KWT120BC-03</b>	<b>PC68294</b>	<b>\$133.99 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	1	\$194.62	\$194.62	HON - H80193-PP	PC68432	\$445.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	WB MASON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>JEFFERSON COUNTY SOCIAL SERVICES</b>						
	250 ARSENAL STREET WATERTOWN NY 13601						
35	CHAIR, BIG AND TALL, FABRIC BLACK COLOR, OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 42.91"H x 30.31"W x 30.31"D, SEAT HEIGHT: 19.2 - 22.85"H (ADJUSTABLE), BACK: 22"W, SEAT: 22"W, ADJUSTABLE PADDED ARMRESTS, SWIVEL WITH REAR TILT, FIVE-POINT BASED WITH WHEELS, LUMBAR SUPPORT, MESH BACK, SUPPORTS UP TO 350LBS, 5 YR WARRANTY, STAPLES SADIE MODEL #BSXVST141	10	ORDERING 8				
	<b>INTERIOR INNOVATIONS</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$258.00</b>	<b>\$2,580.00</b>	<b>HON - HVST141 (EXACT MATCH)</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$516.00 LIST</b>
	INTIVITY	10	\$659.97	\$6,599.70	HON - HIWM8.A.A.U.CU10.T.SB	PC68432	\$1509.00 LIST
	JUST THE RIGHT STUFF	10	\$385.79	\$3,857.90	OFFICE SOURCE 11701	N/A	\$1110.00 LIST
	NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE	10	\$350.76	\$3,507.65	HON HVST141 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	WB MASON	10	\$320.65	\$3,206.50	HON BSXVST141 (EXACT MATCH)	N/A	N/A
	ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.						
	THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.						
	THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.						
		5/27/22					
	PURCHASING		DATE				